County of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House

195 Arsenal Street

Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077

Fax: 315-785-7591

Buyers v Director
Karin Dorr Mark Sachetti, CPPB

Amanda McCracken

Email Addresses:
marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us

amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore

Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

NOTICE OF AWARD

December 4, 2020

ATTN CONNIE KALER
NCC SYSTEMS INC
25646 NYS ROUTE 3
WATERTOWN NY 13601

BID #20-34 NAME: ALARM SYSTEM SERVICES FOR JEFFERSON COUNTY FACILITIES AND

JEFFERSON COMMUNITY COLLEGE

CONTRACT PERIOD: JANUARY 1, 2021 - DECEMBER 31, 2023 w/ optional 1 year extension

Dear Ms. Kaler:

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full

compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.
The following documents are required before a Contract/Purchase Order is issued:

V Proof of New York State Disability/Worker’s Compensation

If yourave any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

chasing Director
MS/am
C:  Department, Auditor, Bid File, Casco Systems, Volney Multiplex
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ALARM SYSTEM SERVICES FOR JEFFERSON COUNTY FACILITIES AND JCC

BID #20-34
BID TABULATION
Option 1: Option 2: Option 3:
Inspection and Testin F:ulimaintenance
P 9 Monitoring Service including parts and
Only
. Ig_bor
CASCO SYSTEMS NCC SYSTEMS VOLNEY MULTIPLEX INC
;f”z‘é’;:w 1,:2021 - DECEMBER OPTION 1 OPTION 2 OPTION 3 OPTION 1 OPTION 2 OPTION 3 OPTION 1 OPTION 2 OPTION 3
1. County Office Building $1,840.00 $420.00 $5,000.00] - $1,000.00 $263.40 NO BID
2. Human Services Building $980.00 $420.00 . $1,000.00 $263.40 NO BID
3. Public Safety Building $4,220.00 XX N/A XX $2,000.00 XX N/A XX NO BID
4. Watsitown lntemational Airport $920.00 $420.00 $500.00 $263.40 NO BID
- Terminal
5. Watertown International Airport
| BnsEeA G & Hlarigar $1,440.00 $420.00 $500.00 $263.40 NO BID
6. Watertown International Airport
- ARFF Building $1,640.00 $420.00 $1,000.00 $263.40 NO BID
7. Public Health Facility $720.00 $620.00 $500.00 $263.40 NO BID
8. Court Complex $2,440.00 $420.00 $2,000.00 $263.40 NO BID
9. Highway Garage $360.00 $420.00 $500.00 $263.40 NO BID
10.Historic Courthouse $3,280.00 $420.00 $2,000.00 $263.40 NO BID
Total Cost for County Facilities: $18,340.00 NO\{\{ $3,980.00 $11,000.00 $2,370.60 NO BID
$17,840.00
11, efierson Community $8,200.00 $420.00 $2,000.00 $263.40 NO BID
College
;?NZ%‘:?Y 1;:2022 -DECEMBER OPTION 1 OPTION 2 OPTION 3 OPTION 1 OPTION 2 OPTION 3 OPTION 1 OPTION 2 OPTION 3
1. County Office Building $1,840.00 $420.00 $1,000.00 $263.40 NO BID
2. Human Services Building $980.00 $420.00 $1,000.00 $263.40 NO BID
3. Public Safety Building $4,220.00 XX NJA XX $2,000.00 XX N/A XX NO BID
#vateriowntniemational Alfport $920.00 $420.00 $500.00 $263.40 NO BID
- Terminal
5. Watertown International Airport
HBiisin s Carter & iangsr $1,440.00 $420.00 $500.00 $263.40 NO BID
6. Watertown International Airport
_ ARFF Building $1,640.00 $420.00 $1,000.00 $263.40 NO BID
7. Public Health Facility $720.00 $620.00 $500.00 $263.40 NO BID
8. Court Complex $2,440.00 $420.00 $2,000.00 $263.40 NO BID
9. Highway Garage $360.00 $420.00 $500.00 $263.40 NO BID
10.Historic Courthouse $3,280.00 $420.00 $2,000.00 $263.40 NO BID
Total Cost for County Facilities: $18,340.00 NO\ﬁ $3,980.00 $11,000.00 $2,370.60 NO BID
$17,840.00

(1310-” :ggem” Community $8,200.00 $420.00 $2,000.00 $263.40 NO BID
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ALARM SYSTEM SERVICES FOR JEFFERSON COUNTY FACILITIES AND JCC
BID #20-34
BID TABULATION

Option 1: Option 2: Option 3:
Inspection and Testin Full malntenance
P 9 Monitoring Service including parts and
Only
labor
) CASCO SYSTEMS NCC SYSTEMS VOLNEY MULTIPLEX INC
bt DECEMBER|  oprion 1 OPTION 2 OPTION 3 OPTION 1 OPTION 2 OPTION 1 OPTION 2 OPTION 3
1. County Office Building $1,840.00 $420.00 $1,000.00 $263.40 NO BID
2. Human Services Building $980.00 $420.00 $1,000.00 $263.40 NO BID
3. Public Safety Building $4,220.00 XX N/A XX $2,000.00 XX N/A XX NO BID
g e e $920.00 $420.00 $500.00 $263.40 NO BID
- Terminal
5. Watertown International Airport
~Business Center & Hangar $1,440.00 $420.00 $500.00 $263.40 NO BID
6. Watertown International Airport
- ARFF Building $1,640.00 $420.00 $1,000.00 $263.40 NO BID
7. Public Health Facility $720.00 $620.00 $500.00 $263.40 NO BID
8. Court Complex $2,440.00 $420.00 $2,000.00 $263.40 NO BID
9. Highway Garage $360.00 $420.00 $500.00 $263.40 NO BID
10.Historic Courthouse $3,280.00 $420.00 $2,000.00 $263.40 NO BID
Total Cost for County Facilities: $18,340.00 NO\‘IX $3,980.00 $11,000.00 $2,370.60 NO BID
$17,840.00

1) ::;ers"” ommunity $8,200.00 $420.00 $2,000.00 $263.40 NO BID
Labor rates for services .
provided outside of contract 2021 YEAR 2022 YEAR 2023 YEAR 2021 YEAR 2022 YEAR 2023 YEAR
parameters:
MONDAY - FRIDAY
5:00 PM - 8:00 AM $300.00 $300.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
WEEKEND $300.00 $300.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
HOLIDAY $300.00 $300.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

**/erified pricing discrepancy on Item #3 - vendor will stand by pricing provided.

*Please note that Jefferson Community College may or may not elect to participate in the award.
All rates should reflect Annual Cost.

All Options will be considered separately.

ALL DATA IS PRELIMINARY AND DOCUMENTED AT THE TIME OF BID OPENING, SUBJECT TO ERRORS OR OMISSIONS.
THIS DATA SHOULD NOT BE INTERPRETED AS CONFIRMATION OF BID RESULTS UNLESS SIGNED BY THE JEFFERSON COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.

THIS BID TABULATION DOES NOT IMPLY AN AWARD HAS BEEN MADE UNLESS NOTED.

7 12/et/20
PURCHASING DATE
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